
LIVESTOCK COMMITTEE 
April 4,2024 

 
Meeting called to order by Chairperson Karleen Wilson.  Present are Karleen Wilson, Heather Corbridge, 
Amy Harmon, Glenna Stanley, Jillyan Henddrickson, Jan Webb, Corinne Henderson, Chanel Pratt, Erin 
Sturdivant, Marc Pratt, Crystal Roberts, Millie Tormey, Lara Stanley, Janice Raisanen, Jessica Hay, Mary 
Tryon, Lori Luff, Rayne Reynolds, Jocelyn Ness, Brian Ness, Raylene Sinnett,Crystal Densmore, Jennifer 
Johnson, Jennifer Luce, Melissa Reimers, Sylvia Reimers, Erich Schaal, Sarah Schaal, Leslie Tompkins, 
Mary Yanagawa, and Jaedyn Stone. 
 
Welcome and Pledges. 
Secretary’s Report – Minutes approved as written with correction of new club in  Sutton.  Motion 
seconded.  Motion passed. 
 
Treasurer’s Report - $76,250.85 Money Market, $30,898.54 Checking, $2.77 Savings, $16,484.00 
Charitable Buyers. 
 
Agents Report – Shooting Sports – Last day to sign up is April 5th. Saturday – a workshop – come with an 
idea, 10:00AM to noon.  Alaska State 4-H Horse contest April 11th and 14th at Colony High. 
 
OLD BUSINESS: 
                            a-Livestock camp update – 7/30-31 and 8/1 all day all three days. 
                            b-Non Profit/Moving of funds-Meeting with a gentleman in Utah that has done this 
process.  Best for us would be 501 C3 nonprofit.  Need articles of Corporation.  Have to file a 990 every 
year. 
                           c-Raffle-working on being able to do a raffle. 
                           d-Judge update-Rash Clinic-Is he willing to do a clinic?? 
                           e-Rayne-college judge-Be here on Sunday for judging on Monday. 
                           f-Rally Days-need small tags.  Have plenty of the rest.  Get ahold of the vets 
tomorrow(4/05/24). 
 
NEW BUSINESS: 
                            a-Volunteer checklist/JMLA tasks March-May-Need to get ahold of the slaughter house.  
Leslie Tompkins ordering Banners.  Jillyan makes a motion to have Rayne Reynolds do a post to get 
sponsorship for the Grand and Reserve of all species.  Motion seconded.  Motion passed. 
                           b-State Livestock update-Heather-None 
                           c-Storage of livestock grooming stands for use during off season (fair barn closed). Lori 
Luff will head the committee.  Motion made to make a committee.  Motion seconded.  Motion passed. 
                           d-Motion for each Livestock camp session to count as 1 approved market clinic-Motion 
seconded.  Motion passed. 
 
Persons to be heard: 
                                    a-Bristol Ness-wants to get permission to have a family member bring his animal to 
Rally Days.  Crystal R. makes a motion to let a family member bring his animal.  Motion is seconded.  
Motion is passes. 
                                   b-Avery Luff-wants permission to have a 4-H’er or her brother show her animal at 
the fair, as she will be leaving for college.  Raylene S. makes a motion to let her brother or a 4-H’er show 
her animal. Motion seconded.  Motion passed. 



c-Jessica Hay-Small Stock Camp-to include bird identification, showmanship, feeding, cleaning,etc. 
 
A motion to adourn at 8:55pm.  Motion seconded.  Motion passed.  Meeting adjourned at 8:55pm 


